
Overview Power Mystery - Church Prayer

Chapt 1-
3-14 - spiritual blessings 
coming through grace - hope is 
in Christ

15-23 - hope of our calling, 
riches of glory/inheritance, 
surpassing greatness of His 
power

Mentions the mystery - 
summing up all things in Christ

Chapter 2
1-10 - formerly dead but now 
made alive in Christ
11-22 - you were formerly far 
off but have been brought near 
through the blood of Christ

Mystery - two groups (Jew and 
Gentile) made into one (the 
church or the body) - God’s 
household, holy temple, 
dwelling of God

Chapter 3
1-13 - mystery of Christ - 
Gentiles as fellow heirs
14-21 - prayer - strengthened 
with power, Christ dwell in 
hearts

Church is to be His glory

Eph 1:19 - surpassing 
greatness of God’s power 
toward those who believe
Eph 3:16 - comes through the 
Holy Spirit in the inner man
Eph 3:20 - power works in us

Acts 1:8 - receive the power 
when the Holy Spirit comes - 
empowers us to be God’s 
witnesses

Acts 3:1-12 - people wondered 
by what power the man was 
healed - power was in the 
name of Jesus Christ

II Cor 12:7-10 - power is 
perfected in weakness, when I 
am weak - He is strong

I Cor 2:4-5 - our faith should 
not rest on the wisdom of men 
but on the power of God

I Pet 1:3-5 - I am protected by 
the power of God

Eph 3:5 - mystery was revealed 
to His holy apostles and 
prophets in the Spirit

Eph 3:6-7 - Gentiles are
- fellow heirs
- Fellow members of the body
- Fellow partakers of the 

promise in Christ through the 
Gospel

Eph 3:9-10 - the mystery was 
hidden in God so that the 
manifold wisdom of God would 
be made known through the 
church to the rulers and 
authorities

Eph 3:11-12 - there is an 
eternal purpose - there is 
boldness and confident access 
to the Father through Jesus 
Christ

Eph 3:14-15
Every family derives its name 
from God the Father

God grant (16-19)
- riches of His glory
- Strengthened with power 

through His Spirit
- That we may comprehend - to 

know the love of Christ that 
surpasses knowledge

- Be filled up to all the fullness 
of God

Lesson 6 - Chapter 3


